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Preface 
This publication is jointly sponsored by three new and vigorous Australian 
associations concerned, each in its distinctive way, with the Study of Religion: 
The Australian and New Zealand Society for Theological Studies 
(ANZSTS), The Australian Association for the Study of Religions (AASR) 
and The Australian and New Zealand Association of Theological Schools 
(ANZATS). 

Papers by distinguished scholars and reports resulting from intensive 
workshops on "the Australian context" make up the twelve chapters in this 
book. All were presented at the ANZSTS/ ANZATS joint Annual Confer­
ence at La Trobe University, Melbourne, in August, 1978. Their final 
appearance in book form owes much to the initiative of Dr. Douglas 
Fullerton, Secretary of ANZATS. 

The AASR was also holding its Annual National Conference during the same 
week and in the same College quarters. This meant jointly sponsored major 
speakers, dual or triple registrations, and daily vigorous interaction among 
Conference delegates. The result was a stimulating encounter among 
representatives of various disciplines and religious traditions. 

Our three Associations are delighted to co-sponsor this volume. It affords a 
glimpse of the vitality of one dimension of one of the world's great religious 
movements. Here Christian thinkers seek to understand in depth their specific 
contemporary context in order the better to express therein and thereto the 
heart, mind, soul and strength of their tradition. 

Romuald Green, President ANZA TS 
Eric Pyle, President AASR 

D'Arcy Wood, President ANZSTS 
May, 1979 
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